
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 14-0401

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools

TIME & (January 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 12, 2013
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM 1. BAR, ALIGNING PRY:
15 ea. PRICE 9.33 10.88
SIZE 1/2" X 16" (9379) TOTAL 139.95 163.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Urrea 2116 Urrea 2116
10 ea. PRICE 11.64 15.15
SIZE 5/8" X 18" ROLLING HEAD (9382) TOTAL 116.40 151.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Urrea 2120 Urrea 2120
10 ea. PRICE 19.34 20.16
SIZE 3/4" X 24" (9378) TOTAL 193.40 201.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Urrera 2124 Urrera 2124
 PRICE *  
 TOTAL   NO BID NO BID NO BID

 TOTAL FOR ITEM 1 MFG/MODEL 449.75 516.30
ITEM 2 BLADE:

10 ea. PRICE 2.07
CUTTING, SIZE 6, TPI 7, WOOD (9663) TOTAL 20.70 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Amer. Lenox 20560-606R

40 ea. PRICE 1.65
CUTTING, SIZE 6, TPI 10, FINE WOOD (9664) TOTAL 66.00 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW4806
5 ea. PRICE 1.29
CUTTING, SIZE 4-1/8", TPI 6, WOOD (9665) TOTAL 6.45 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Amer. Lenox BT486J
20 ea. PRICE 3.47
HACKSAW, SIZE 9, TPI 10, (9670) TOTAL 69.40 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Amer. Saw 20597-96OR
15 ea. PRICE 0.94
HACKSAW, SIZE 12, TPI 14, (9669) TOTAL 14.10 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper NF1214
10 ea. PRICE 0.94
HACKSAW, SIZE 12, TPI 24, (9666) TOTAL 9.40 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper NF1224

1,000 ea. PRICE 0.91
HACKSAW, SIZE 12, TPI 32, (9668) TOTAL 910.00 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper NF1232

10 ea. PRICE 1.28
JIGSAW, SIZE 4, TPI 10 (9671) TOTAL 12.80 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

8. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW3710H
100 ea. PRICE 8.15
BLADE PVC PIPE SAW 18INTPI 11, LENOX HSB18 (9672) TOTAL 815.00 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

9. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Amer. Lenox 20981
*

 TOTAL  INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
 TOTAL ITEM 2 MFG/MODEL 1,923.85
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 14-0401

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools

TIME & (January 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 12, 2013
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ITEM 3 DRILL BIT, HIGH SPEED:
25 ea. PRICE 0.52 0.91 0.41 0.56
SIZE 1/16" (11461) TOTAL 13.00 22.75 10.25 14.00 NO BID

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America D/AN 1/16 Champion 705 SP-1/16 Milwaukee 48-89-2820 Hertel 71205637
35 ea. PRICE 0.49 1.04 0.49 0.55
SIZE 1/8" (11464) TOTAL 17.15 36.40 17.15 19.25 NO BID

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America D/AN 1/8 Champion 705 SP-1/18 Milwaukee 48-89-2824 Hertel 71205678
50 ea. PRICE 0.97 1.85 1.07 1.08
SIZE 1/4" (11463) TOTAL 48.50 92.50 53.50 54.00 NO BID

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America D/AN 1/4 Champion 705 SP-1/4 Milwaukee 48-89-2832 Hertel 71205751
15 ea. PRICE 4.09 7.09 5.16 4.32
SIZE 1/2" (11462) TOTAL 61.35 106.35 77.40 64.80 NO BID

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America D/AN 1/2 Champion 705 SP-1/2 Milwaukee 48-89-2848 Hertel 71205918
15 ea. PRICE 0.73 1.31 0.77 0.78
SIZE 3/16" (11472) TOTAL 10.95 19.65 11.55 11.70 NO BID

5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America D/AN 3/16 Champion 705 SP-3/16 Milwaukee 48-89-2828 Hertel 71205710
10 ea. PRICE 0.65 0.91 0.46 0.60
SIZE 3/32" (11474) TOTAL 6.50 9.10 4.60 6.00 NO BID

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America D/AN 3/32 Champion 705 SP-3/32 Milwaukee 48-89-2822 Hertel 71205652
30 ea. PRICE 2.35 4.16 2.20 2.25
SIZE 3/8" (11475) TOTAL 70.50 124.80 66.00 67.50 NO BID

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America D/AN 3/8 Champion 705 SP-3/8 Milwaukee 48-89-2840 Hertel 71205835
20 ea. PRICE 1.80 2.91 1.57 1.54
SIZE 5/16" (11476) TOTAL 36.00 58.20 31.40 30.80 NO BID

8. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America D/AN 5/16 Champion 705 SP-5/16 Milwaukee 48-89-2836 Hertel 71205793
20 ea. PRICE 0.90 1.24 0.66 0.64
SIZE 5/32" (11477) TOTAL 18.00 24.80 13.20 12.80 NO BID

9. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America D/AN 5/32 champion 705 SP-5/32 Milwaukee 48-89-2826 Hertel 71205694
10 ea. PRICE 4.21 5.55 4.07 2.84
SIZE 7/16" (11478) TOTAL 42.10 55.50 40.70 28.40 NO BID

10. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America D/AN 7/16 Champion 705 SP-7/16 Milwaukee 48-89-2844 Hertel 71205876
 10 ea. UNIT 1.27 1.68 0.93 1.09

SIZE 7/32" (11479) PRICE 12.70 16.80 9.30 10.90 NO BID
11. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Drill America D/AN 7/32 Champion 705 SP-7/32 Milwaukee 48-89-2830 Hertel 71205736

10 ea. UNIT 0.75 1.03 0.47 0.83
SIZE 7/64" (11480) PRICE 7.50 10.30 4.70 8.30 NO BID

12. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Drill America D/AN 7/64 Champion 705 SP-7/64 Milwaukee 48-89-2823 Hertel 71205660
20 ea. UNIT 1.81 2.33 1.46 1.38
SIZE 9/32" (11481) PRICE 36.20 46.60 29.20 27.60 NO BID

13. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Drill America D/AN 9/32 Champion 705 SP-9/32 Milwaukee 48-89-2834 Hertel 71205777
10 ea. UNIT 0.79 1.21 0.63 0.60
SIZE 9/64" (11482) PRICE 7.90 12.10 6.30 6.00 NO BID

14. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Dewalt DW5732 Champion 705 SP-9/64 Milwaukee 48-89-2825 Hertel 71205686
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 14-0401

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools

TIME & (January 1, 2014 through December 31, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 12, 2013
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10 ea. UNIT 2.65 3.63 1.97 1.90
SIZE 11/32" (11465) PRICE 26.50 36.30 19.70 19.00 NO BID

15. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Drill America D/AN 11/32 Champion 705 SP-11/32 Milwaukee 48-89-2838 Hertel 71205819
10 ea. UNIT 0.89 1.20 0.68 0.81
SIZE 11/64" (11466) PRICE 8.90 12.00 6.80 8.10 NO BID

16. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Drill America D/AN 11/64 Champion 705 SP-11/64 Milwaukee 48-89-2827 Hertel 71205702
10 ea. UNIT 3.85 5.05 3.54 3.16
SIZE 13/32" (11467) PRICE 38.50 50.50 35.40 31.60 NO BID

17. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Drill America D/AN 13/32 Champion 705 SP 13/32 Milwaukee 48-89-2842 Hertel 71205850
10 ea. UNIT 1.05 1.46 0.86 0.79
SIZE 13/64" (11468) PRICE 10.50 14.60 8.60 7.90 NO BID

18. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Drill America D/AN 13/64 Champion 705 SP 13/64 Milwaukee 48-89-2829 Hertel 71205728
10 ea. UNIT 4.95 6.77 4.87 4.28
SIZE 15/32" (11469) PRICE 49.50 67.70 48.70 42.80 NO BID

19. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Drill America D/AN 15/32 Champion 705 SP-15/32 Milwaukee 48-89-2846 Hertel 71205892
10 ea. PRICE 1.25 1.77 1.00 1.46
SIZE 15/64" (11470) TOTAL 12.50 17.70 10.00 14.60 NO BID

20. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America D/AN 15/64 Champion 705 SP-15/64 Milwaukee 48-89-2831 Hertel 71205744
10 ea. PRICE 1.68 2.26 1.27 1.72
SIZE 17/64" (11471) TOTAL 16.80 22.60 12.70 17.20 NO BID

21. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America D/AN 17/64 Champion 705 SP-17/64 Milwaukee 48-89-2833 Hertel 71205769
*

      NO BID
 TOTAL ITEM 3 TOTAL 551.55 857.25 517.15 503.25
ITEM 4 DRILL BIT, GENERAL PURPOSE:

10 ea. PRICE 0.45 0.91 0.58 0.66
SIZE 1/16" (11454) TOTAL 4.50 9.10 5.80 6.60 NO BID

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DWDN 1/16 Champion 705-SP-1/16 Milwaukee 48-89-2820 Hertel 71205637
10 ea. PRICE 2.80 5.55 5.88 2.84
SIZE 7/16" (11502) TOTAL 28.00 55.50 58.80 28.40 NO BID

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DWDN 7/16 Champion 705 SP-7/16 Milwaukee 48-89-2844 Hertel 71205876
10 ea. PRICE 8.25 14.00 11.73 9.65
SIZE 9/16" X 1/2" SHANK (11458) TOTAL 82.50 140.00 117.30 96.50 NO BID

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DWDRSD 9/16 Champion US12-9116 Milwaukee 48-89-2740 Hertel 77428613
5 ea. PRICE 8.35 16.00 13.37 12.40
SIZE 5/8" X 1/2" SHANK (11456) TOTAL 41.75 80.00 66.85 62.00 NO BID

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DWDRSD 5/8 Champion US12-5/8 Milwaukee 48-89-2742 Hertel 77428662
10 ea. 11.25 19.00 11.54 10.50
SIZE 3/4" (11455)  112.50 190.00 115.40 105.00 NO BID

5. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Drill America DWDRSD 3/4 Champion US12-3/4 Milwaukee 48-89-2746 Hertel 43481365
10 ea. PRICE 12.90 23.50 13.58 287.17
SIZE 7/8" (11457) TOTAL 129.00 235.00 135.80 2,871.70 NO BID

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DWDRSD 7/18 Champion US12-7/8 Milwaukee 48-89-2750 Sumitomo U101521
10 ea. PRICE 17.50 30.00 18.50 308.00
SIZE 1" (11459) TOTAL 175.00 300.00 185.00 3,080.00 NO BID

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DWDRSD1 Champion US12-1 Milwaukee 48-89-2754 Sumitomo U101529
*

      NO BID
 TOTAL ITEM 4 TOTAL 573.25 1,009.60 684.95 6,250.20
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS
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FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools
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ITEM 5 DRILL BIT, MASONRY:
15 ea. PRICE 0.76 2.04
SIZE 1/4" (11488) TOTAL 11.40 NO BID 30.60 INCOMPLETE NO BID

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DAM4x1/4 Milwaukee 48-20-8811
15 ea. PRICE 1.31 3.37
SIZE 3/8" (11490) TOTAL 19.65 NO BID 50.55 INCOMPLETE NO BID

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DAM 4x3/8 Milwaukee 48-20-8821
10 ea. PRICE 1.01 2.79
SIZE 5/16" (11491) TOTAL 10.10 NO BID 27.90 INCOMPLETE NO BID

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DAM 4x5/16 Milwaukee 48-20-8816
5 ea. PRICE 1.94 3.73
SIZE 7/16" (11492) TOTAL 9.70 NO BID 18.65 INCOMPLETE NO BID

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DAM 4x7/16 Milwaukee 48-20-8825
5 ea. PRICE 2.60 5.80
SIZE 9/16" (11494) TOTAL 13.00 NO BID 29.00 INCOMPLETE NO BID

5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DAM 6x9/16x3/8 Milwaukee 48-20-8835

5 ea. PRICE 6.70 6.48
SIZE 3/4" (11489) TOTAL 33.50 NO BID 32.40 INCOMPLETE NO BID

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DAM 6x3/4 Milwaukee 48-20-8845
5 ea. PRICE 7.60 11.08
SIZE 7/8" (11493) TOTAL 38.00 NO BID 55.40 INCOMPLETE NO BID

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DAM 6x7/8 Milwaukee 48-20-8847
10 ea. PRICE 0.96 3.96
SIZE 3/16" X 4", (11496) TOTAL 9.60 NO BID 39.60 INCOMPLETE NO BID

8. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DAM 4x3/16 Milwaukee 48-20-8806
5 ea. PRICE 3.47 9.04
SIZE 5/8" X 8", W/ 3/8" SHANK (11487) TOTAL 17.35 NO BID 45.20 INCOMPLETE NO BID

9. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DAM 6x5/8x3/8 Milwaukee 48-20-8841
5 ea. PRICE 6.64 9.04
SIZE 5/8" X 12", (11485) TOTAL 33.20 NO BID 45.20 INCOMPLETE NO BID

10. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL DAM 13x5/8x12 Milwaukee 48-20-8840
5 ea. PRICE 7.50 8.68
SIZE 1/2" X 12", (11484) TOTAL 37.50 NO BID 43.40 INCOMPLETE NO BID

11. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DAM 13x1/2x3/8 Milwaukee 48-20-8831

5 ea. PRICE 7.50 9.81
SIZE 1/2" X 16", W/ 3/8" SHANK (11498) TOTAL 37.50 NO BID 49.05 INCOMPLETE NO BID

12. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DAM 18x1/2 Milwaukee 48-20-8832
5 ea. PRICE 11.30 12.62
SIZE 3/4" X 13", (11483) CARBIDE TIP TOTAL 56.50 NO BID 63.10 INCOMPLETE NO BID

13. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DAM 13x3/4 Milwaukee 48-20-8846
5 ea. PRICE 16.75 15.86
SIZE 1" X 10", W/ 1/2" SHANK (11486) TOTAL 83.75 NO BID 79.30 INCOMPLETE NO BID

14. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DAM 13x1 Milwaukee 48-20-8854
5 ea. PRICE 16.75 15.86
SIZE 1" X 12", (11495) TOTAL 83.75 NO BID 79.30 INCOMPLETE NO BID

15. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Drill America DAM 13x1 Milwaukee 48-20-8854
 *
  NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
TOTAL ITEM 5 TOTAL 494.50 688.65
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ITEM 6 DRILL BIT HAMMER, MASONRY:
5 ea. PRICE 12.55 19.80 10.97
SIZE 3/8" X 11" SPLINE (11506) TOTAL 62.75 99.00 54.85 NO BID NO BID

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5700 Dewalt DW5700 Milwaukee 48-20-4037
10 ea. PRICE 5.64 9.00 5.36
SIZE 3/8" X 12" SDS (11503) TOTAL 56.40 90.00 53.60 NO BID NO BID

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5430 Dewalt DW5430 Milwaukee 48-20-7454
 5 ea. PRICE 15.41 20.00 12.60

SIZE 3/8" X 20" SDS (11504) TOTAL 77.05 100.00 63.00 NO BID NO BID
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5432 Dewalt DW5432 Milwaukee 48-20-7459

10 ea. PRICE 6.94 11.30 6.53
SIZE 1/2" X 12" (11497) TOTAL 69.40 113.00 65.30 NO BID NO BID

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5439 Dewalt DW5439 Milwaukee 48-20-7474
5 ea. PRICE 16.52 19.80 12.69
SIZE 1/2" X 16" SPLINE (11505) TOTAL 82.60 99.00 63.45 NO BID NO BID

5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5704 Dewalt DW5704 Milwaukee 48-20-4051
5 ea. PRICE 19.84 37.00 19.02
SIZE 1/2" X 23" SPLINE (11507) TOTAL 99.20 185.00 95.10 NO BID NO BID

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5705 Dewalt DW5706 Milwaukee 48-20-4053
5 ea. PRICE 68.13 70.05 43.85
SIZE 1 1/2" X 23" SPLINE (11508) TOTAL 340.65 350.25 219.25 NO BID NO BID

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5732 Milwaukee 48-20-4151 Milwaukee 48-20-4151
 *
 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL ITEM 6 TOTAL 788.05 1,036.25 614.55

ITEM 7 FILES:
10 ea. UNIT

SIZE 6", BASTARD FLAT (11887) PRICE 4.49 INCOMPLETE NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
1. NICHOLSON 3467 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL 44.90

15 ea. UNIT

SIZE 8", BASTARD FLAT (11888) PRICE 5.58 INCOMPLETE NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
2. NICHOLSON 3566 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL 83.70

15 ea. UNIT

SIZE 10", BASTARD FLAT (11885) PRICE 6.90 INCOMPLETE NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
3. NICHOLSON 3665 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL 103.50

15 ea. UNIT

SIZE 12", BASTARD FLAT (11886) PRICE 10.34 INCOMPLETE NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
4. NICHOLSON 3764 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL 155.10

20 ea. UNIT

SIZE 14", BASTARD FLAT (11889) PRICE 12.63 INCOMPLETE NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
5. NICHOLSON 3863 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL 252.60

15 ea. UNIT

NICHOLSON 11781 OR APPROVED EQUAL PRICE 4.20 INCOMPLETE NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
6. SIZE 6", BASTARD ROUND, RAT TAIL (11892) TOTAL 63.00

10 ea. UNIT

SIZE 10", BASTARD ROUND (11890) PRICE 5.31 INCOMPLETE NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
7. NICHOLSON 12019 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL 53.10

40 ea. UNIT

SIZE 14", RASP HORSE FILE, (15086) PRICE 17.98 INCOMPLETE NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
8. NICHOLSON 18057N OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL 719.20

 *
 INCOMPLETE NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
TOTAL ITEM 7 TOTAL 1,475.10
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ITEM 8 CHISELS:
15 ea. UNIT 2.31 4.96
SIZE 1/2", COLD (10343) PRICE 34.65 74.40 NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

1. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Stanley 16-287 Proto 86A 7/16
25 ea. UNIT 2.85 7.07
SIZE 3/4", COLD (10344) PRICE 71.25 176.75 NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

2. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Stanley 16-289 Proto 86A 5/8
35 ea. UNIT 3.67 11.07
SIZE 1" X 7 1/2", COLD (10342) PRICE 128.45 387.45 NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

3. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Stanley 16-290 Proto 86A 7/8 x 8
10 ea. UNIT 10.54 12.76
SIZE 1-1/2", WOOD (10346) PRICE 105.40 127.60 NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

4. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Stanley 16-980 Stanley 16-980
 *
 NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
TOTAL ITEM 8 TOTAL 339.75 766.20

ITEM 9 SAW:
50 ea. UNIT 15.09
SAW PVC W/BLADE 18IN HSF180, LENOX 20980 (15586) PRICE 754.50 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID NO BID

1. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Amer. Saw Lenox 20980
20 ea. UNIT 9.69
SAW HAND 8 POINT 26 IN, STANLEY 15-526 (15587) PRICE 193.80 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID NO BID

2. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Nicholson N51501
 *
  INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID NO BID
TOTAL ITEM 9 TOTAL 948.30

ITEM 10 MISCELLANEOUS TOOLS:
15 ea. PRICE 62.85
SIZE 20" X 8-1/2" X 9-1/2", TOOL BOX (16850) TOTAL 942.75 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Klein 54401
5 sets PRICE 114.02
HOLESAW, 1/4" ARBOR ADPT METAL (15890) JOURNEYMANS SET TOTAL 570.10 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Klein 31635
5 sets PRICE  
RULE FOLDING 6FT (15502) TOTAL 13.75 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

3. LUFKIN 1066D OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL 68.75
5 sets PRICE  
TAPE STEEL CIRCULAR 1/4 X6FT (16525) TOTAL 13.75 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

4. LUFKIN W606PD OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL 68.75
5 sets PRICE  
TAPE MEASURE NON-METAL 100 FT (16515) TOTAL 82.03 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

5. LUFKIN HD406 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL 410.15
20 ea. PRICE  
SIZE 26", SAW, STANDARD CABLE (15602) TOTAL 9.75 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

6. MCMASTER CARR 39705A31 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL 195.00
30 ea. PRICE  
SIZE 46", SAW, STANDARD CABLE (15603) TOTAL 11.25 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

7. MCMASTER CARR 39705A32 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL 337.50
20 ea. PRICE  
MEASURING WHEEL, TAPE, (16512) TOTAL 55.56 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

8. SIZE 0 – 9999 FEET LUFKIN MW38 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL 1,111.20
70 sets PRICE  
PUMP UTILITY 1 1/2 DIS 13 GPM, (15067) TOTAL 49.40 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

9. BECKSON 136PF6 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL 3,458.00
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75 ea. PRICE  
TAPE MEASURE OD 38IN X 10FT (16509) TOTAL 6.65 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

10. JIM-GEM 39480 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL 498.75
15 ea. PRICE  
SETTER VALVE 4-12IN, (33730) TOTAL 163.70 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

11. RAPTOR 41038 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL 2,455.50
50 ea. PRICE  
GUN GREASE LEVERTYPE, (13021) TOTAL 20.50 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

12. LINCOLN 1142 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL 1,025.00
 *
 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
TOTAL ITEM 10 11,141.45

ITEM 11 Proto Pirce List (Estimated Annual Usage $45,000)
INCOMPLETE NO BID

Price List Catalog Number PR-011513 PR-011514 2013/2014 USC
*

INCOMPLETE NO BID
Discount Off Price List (%) 56% -55% 53%

INCOMPLETE NO BID
Multiplier for Discount 0.44 .45 .47

INCOMPLETE NO BID
Effective Date of Price List Jan. 15, 2013 Jan. 15, 2014 8/1/13

ITEM 12 Goldblatt (Stanley) Price List (Estimated Annual Usage $20,000)
INCOMPLETE NO BID

Price List Catalog Number SIT-011513 SIT-011514 MSC 2013-2014
 *

INCOMPLETE NO BID
Discount Off Price List (%) 50% 40% 53%

INCOMPLETE NO BID
Multiplier for Discount .5 0.60 .47

INCOMPLETE NO BID
Effective Date of Price List Jan. 1, 2013 Jan. 15, 2014 8/1/13

ITEM 13 Ridgid Price List (Estimated Annual Usage $12,000) *
INCOMPLETE NO BID

Price List Catalog Number 313 313-R MSC 2013-2014

INCOMPLETE NO BID
Discount Off Price List (%) 12% See Notes 12.8%

INCOMPLETE NO BID
Multiplier for Discount 0.88 See Notes .872

INCOMPLETE NO BID
Effective Date of Price List 3/2013 March 1, 2013 8/1/13

ITEM 14 Klein Price List (Estimated Annual Usage $10,000)
NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

Price List Catalog Number Klein 2014 MSC 2013-2014
*

NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
Discount Off Price List (%) 25% 10.6%
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NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
Multiplier for Discount 0.75 .894

NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
Effective Date of Price List 1-2014 8/1/13

ITEM 15 Copper Price List (Estimated Annual Usage $10,000)
 NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

Price List Catalog Number CHT-012513 MSC 2013-2014
 *
 NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

Discount Off Price List (%)  40% 20%

NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
Multiplier for Discount .60 .80

NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID
Effective Date of Price List Jan. 2013 8/1/13

ITEM 16 Reed Price List (Estimated Annual Usage $12,000)
INCOMPLETE NO BID NO BID

Price List Catalog Number 20131014 01004  
*

INCOMPLETE NO BID NO BID
Discount Off Price List (%) 15% -20%

INCOMPLETE NO BID NO BID
Multiplier for Discount .85 .80

INCOMPLETE NO BID NO BID
Effective Date of Price List 10/14/2013 July 1, 2011

TOTAL AWARD 82,345.95 24,000.00 614.55 20,503.25

EXTENSION 1 82,345.95 24,000.00 614.55 20,503.25

EXTESNION 2 82,345.95 24,000.00 614.55 20,503.25

EXTESNION 3 82,345.95 24,000.00 614.55 20,503.25

Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 10-14 days 7-10 days 2 days

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
 
Alamo Dist. Dba AIW SAWS Website
Crawford Electric Supply Co.

 Morris Machine Tool & Supply  
MSC Industrial Supply
Myers Tire Supply
PDME, Inc.  
Royall Matthiessen

Tool Mart, Inc.
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